

Holcim	PJ Keating	Newport
---------------	-------------------	----------------

Item #1	P/U	\$ 84.44	\$ 82.00	No Bid
	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 94.00	No Bid
	Escalation	6%	5%	

Item #2	P/U	\$ 82.44	\$ 80.00	No Bid
	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 92.00	No Bid
	Escalation	6%	5%	

Item #3	P/U	\$ 96.44	\$ 110.00	No Bid
	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 122.00	No Bid
	Escalation	6%	5%	

Item #4	P/U	\$ 155.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Deliver	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Escalation	6%		

Item #5	P/U	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Deliver	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Escalation			

Item #6	P/U	No Bid	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00	Coin toss to break tie was conducted 6/21/23. Newport won.
	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	
	Escalation		10%	5%	

Item #7	P/U	No Bid	\$ 10.00	\$ 17.00
	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 27.00
	Escalation		10%	5%

Item #8	P/U	No Bid	\$ 16.50	\$ 18.00
	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 26.50	\$ 28.00
	Escalation		10%	5%

Item #9	P/U	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 8.00
	Deliver	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.00
	Escalation		NA	

Item #10	Deliver	No Bid	\$ 10.00	10.00
----------	---------	--------	----------	-------